
BID RESULT 
LINDEWOLD BOE
LINDENWOLD HS/ADMIN/S4  SITEWORK IMPROVEMENTS
RYEBREAD PROJECT #5713D

 19 April 2023 @ 2:00 PM

Bidder Base-Bid (HS & Admin.) Alt #1-(S4) Total

R.E. Pierson $474,396.98 $328,552.56 $802,949.54

Command Co. $479,000.00 $288,000.00 $767,000.00

Landberg Construction $494,500.00 $214,500.00 $709,000.00

DeMeglio Construction $410,800.00 $226,350.00 $637,150.00

American Asphalt NO BID NO BID -

Earle Construction Co. NO BID NO BID -

Paving Plus NO BID NO BID -

Average $464,674.25 $264,350.64 $729,024.89


