
BID RESULT FORM
MEDFORD TOWNSHIP BOE
BRICK REPOINTING/COATED FOAM ROOF REPAIRS
MILTON ALLEN SCHOOL
RYEBREAD PROJECT #5714A

 03 MAY 2023 @ 2:00 PM

Bidder Base-Bid Alternate Bid 01 TOTAL

Jones Masonry Restoration 160,000.00 12,500.00 172,500.00
Duall Restoration 177,000.00 9,600.00 186,600.00

Premier Building Restoration 226,680.00 11,720.00 238,400.00

A1 Construction Service 210,000.00 42,000.00 252,000.00
Jessco Construction 253,119.00 NO BID 253,119.00
Madina Restoration 215,786.00 48,000.00 263,786.00
Ocean Construction 277,765.00 10,470.00 288,235.00
JJD Urethane NO BID NO BID NO BID

E.J.W. Restoration NO BID NO BID NO BID

A to Z Coatings NO BID NO BID NO BID
Union Roofing NO BID NO BID NO BID
Hygrade Insulators NO BID NO BID NO BID
Average 217,192.86 22,381.67 236,377.14


