
BID RESULTS
PARTIAL HVAC SYSTEMS REPLACEMENT-LINDENWOLD MS AND SCHOOL 5
RYEBREAD PROJECT #5713A/B

20 July 2023 @ 2:00 PM

Bidder Base-Bid Alternate 5.1 Alternate 5.2 Alternate MS.1 Total
FALASCA MECHANICAL $7,986,000.00 $298,600.00 $199,600.00 $154,600.00 $8,638,800.00
THERMAL PIPING $8,600,000.00 $288,000.00 $165,500.00 $194,000.00 $9,247,500.00
DOLAN MECHANICAL $9,261,000.00 $281,000.00 $241,000.00 $171,000.00 $9,954,000.00
GAUDELLI BROTHERS $9,922,000.00 $372,000.00 $118,000.00 $199,200.00 $10,611,200.00
SURETY MECHANICAL NO BID - - - -
KASER MECHANICAL NO BID - - - -
WEST END KB NO BID - - - -
EACM CORP. NO BID - - - -

Average $8,942,250.00 $309,900.00 $181,025.00 $179,700.00 $9,612,875.00

ALTERNATES

5.1   Classrooms 126, 127, 128 - School #5.
5.2   Remove and Replace APC Ceilings and Grid in All Classrooms-School #5.
MS.1 Classroom/Office Lights & APC-Middle School


